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MI NUT E S OF THE SPE CI A L MEET I NG OF THE BOA RD OF TRUST EE S  
SOUT HE RN ILL I NO IS UNIV E RS IT Y  

FEB RUA RY 8, 2023  
 
 

Pursu an t to notice, a spe cia l mee t in g of the Boa rd of Tru ste e s of Sou th e rn 

Illin o is Unive rsit y con ve n ed at 3:0 0 p.m . , W ed n e sd a y, Feb ru a ry 8, in the Spe cia l Eve n t s 

Roo m , Birge r Hall, SIU Edwa rd svi lle , Edwa rd svil le , Illin o is.  The meet in g was calle d to orde r 

by Cha ir J. Phil Gilb e rt .  The follo win g mem bers of the Boa rd were physica ll y pre se n t :    

Hon. J. Phil Gilb e rt, Cha ir  
Dr. Ed High t o we r, Vice Cha ir  
Dr. Sub h a sh Sha rma , Secre t a ry  
Ms. Dorca s Bro u  
Mr. Ed Curt is  
Ms. Haile e O ’ De ll  
Ms. Sara M. Salge r  
Mr. Joh n Simmo n s –  vi a Zoom vid e o conf e re nce 
Mr. Roge r Ted rick –  via Zoom vid e o co nf e re n ce  
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Cha ir Gilb e rt exp la in e d the pro ced u re s for the pub lic comm en t and que st ion 

port io n of the Boa rd ’ s age n d a .  The re were no spea ke rs sign e d up to spea k.  

Cha ir Gilb e rt turn ed the f loo r ove r to Vice Pre sid e nt Gup chu p to intro d u ce 

the SIUE Stu d en t Pre se n t at io n .  Vice Pre siden t Gup ch up introd u ce d the follo win g  f ro m the 

Dep a rtm e n t of Con st ruct io n , SIUE Sch oo l of Engin e e rin g :  David She rrill, Pro g ra m Dire ct o r, 

Land Surve yin g and Geom a t ic s; Joh n Caba ge , Cha ir, Dep a rt men t of Con st ru ct io n; Mr. 

Crist ia n Tola va , Civil En gin e e rin g Mast e r of Scien ce cand id a te , futu re PhD stud en t , 

colla b o ra t io n with SIUC; Dr. Che n xi Yua n , Assist a nt Prof e sso r; Ms. Mika yla h Burris, 

Pre sid e nt , Con st ru ct o rs Clu b , SIUE ; and Ms. Om on e (No ra ) Ake re, Pre sid e nt , ACI C lu b .  

The gro u p pre se n te d on “ En r ich in g and Enga gin g Stu d en t s Thro u gh 

Part n e rsh ip s. ”  
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Bef o re Chan ce llo r Min o r bega n with his pre se nt a t ion Cha ir Gilb e rt 

ackn o wle d ge d tha t Trust e e s Bro u and Ted rick were also pre sen t .  

Cha n ce llo r Min o r discu sse d  thre e dyn a m ics tha t  pro vid e im po rt a nt con t e xt 

as rela t ed to ben ch markin g:  f irst , the price ela st icit y stu d y which is a market - p rice stud y; 

seco nd ,  the asso cia t ion man y stu d en t s make betwe e n price and the perce ive d valu e ; and 

third ,  balan cin g the actu a l price aga in st the actu a l cost of delive rin g a high - qu a lit y degre e .  

He pro cee d ed by com p a rin g FY2 3 unde rgra d u a te tuit io n and man da t o ry fee s in all 12 

pub lic unive rsit ie s in the stat e of Illin o is and high ligh t e d tha t SIUE has the lowe st 

unde rgra d u a t e entry - l e ve l tuit io n and f ee s cost which inclu d e s both doct o ra l and maste r ’ s 

gra n t in g inst it u t io n s.   

Chan ce llo r Min o r also  discu sse d f ive yea r tuit io n and fee incre a se s am o ng 

the sam e 12  pub lic unive rsit ie s in the sta t e of Illin o is and sho we d whe re SIUE sta n d s 

am on gst the gro u p wit h an ave ra ge of 9.3% avera ge increa se ove r f ive yea rs with only 

thre e inst it u t ion s havin g a lowe r perce n t a ge incre a se ove r the same f ive yea rs.  He also 

discu sse d the FY2 3 roo m and boa rd rate s which also sho ws SIUE as havin g the lowe st 

p rice am o n gst the same 12  pub lic unive rsit ie s in the stat e of Illin o is.   

Chan ce llo r Min o r exp la in e d tha t tuit ion and fees acco un t for nea rly two - t h ird s 

of SIUE ’ s ope rat in g bud ge t .  He furth e r discu sse d inf la t io n and ment io ne d som e of the 

crit ica l cost driv e rs aff ect in g SIUE :  def e rre d main te na n ce, incre a ses in utilit ie s, cla ssro o m 

im p ro ve m en t s, person n e l cost s and hou sin g and din in g cost s.   He con clu de d his 

pre se n ta t ion by sta t in g SIUE ’ s com m itme n t to acce ssib ilit y and aff ord a b ilit y and how this 

comm it me n t must be bala n ced by incre a se s in ope ra t ion a l cost s and the reso u rce s 
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requ ire d to main t a in a high qua lit y tea ch in g envi ro n m en t tha t make an SIUE degree 

valu a b le .  

Cha n ce llo r Lan e sha red a quick revie w of the tuit io n and fee histo ry and the 

tuit io n and f ee r eve n u e f rom FY1 7 to FY2 3 for SIUC alo n g with the app ro p ria t ion s rece ive d 

for the sam e tim e perio d .  Next he discu sse d the desired com m itm en t s f or FY 2 4 ,  

part icu la rly  the estima t e d cost of sala ry incre a se s for rep re sen t e d emp lo ye e s, non -

re p re se nt e d emp lo ye e s , the min imu m wage incre a se and sala ry co m p re ssion s.  He also 

discu sse d the resu lt of inf la t ion and cost s asso cia t ed with utilit y  incre a se s and defe rre d 

main te na n ce .  Add it ion a lly , Cha n ce llo r Lan e talked abou t inte rna l equ it y stu d ie s tha t the 

cam pu s is doin g to add re ss sala rie s of f acu lty and staff who are und e rpa id .  Cha n ce llo r 

Lane pro vid e d an upda t e on the camp u s Fina n cia l Sust a in a b ilit y  Pla n .  The tota l deb t was 

$38.2 millio n with the f irst payb a ck in FY1 8 and the f ina l am o un t due in FY2 4 .   

 Chan ce llo r Lan e con clu d e d by sha rin g  the Sch o o l of Med icin e ’ s goa ls f or 

sett in g tuit io n and fee s:  (1) for the MD pro gram kee p in g tuit ion leve ls com p et it ive with oth er 

comm un it y base d medica l sch o o l s  f or both the tra d it io n a l and Lin co ln Scho la rs pro gra m s; 

(2) for the Physicia n Assist a n t pro gra m kee p in g tuit ion leve ls com pe t it ive with oth e r 

prof e ssion a l PA pro gram s in the regio n ; and (3) for the Docto r of Med ica l Scie n ce kee p in g 

tuit io n comp e t it ive with othe r acad em ic PA pro gra m s.    

Presid e nt Maho n y exp la in e d the SIUC Fin a ncia l Susta in ab ilit y Pla n was a 

dire ct resu lt of the sta t e bud ge t imp a sse seve ra l yea rs ago . Inst e a d of the cam p u s 

abso rb in g the $38.2 millio n all at once it was spre a d out ove r mult ip le yea rs.  

Tru st ee Sha rm a men t io n ed he was told  tha t Purdu e has not raised the ir 

tuit io n f or seve ra l yea rs in a ro w and aske d how the y can do tha t.  Pre sid e n t Maho n y 
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The meet in g adjou rn ed at app ro xim a t e ly 4:35  p .m .    

 

       
 Paula S. Keit h , Exe cu t ive Secre t a ry  
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MINUT E S OF THE REGUL A R MEET I NG OF THE BOA RD OF TRUS TE E S  
SOUT HE RN ILL I NO IS UNIV E RS IT Y  

FEB RUA RY 9, 2023  
 
 

The regu la r meet in g of the Boa rd of Tru ste es of Sou th e rn Illin o is Unive rsit y 

con ve n e d on Thu rsd ay, 
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The Exe cu t ive Secre ta ry rep o rt e d and
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FINA NCE COMMI TT EE  
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Tru st ee Salge r move d tha t the Min ut e s of the Mee t ings held  

Nove m b e r 30 and Dece m be r 1, 202 2, be app ro ve d .  Tru ste e Bro u seco nd e d the motion , 

and the min u te s were app ro ve d by the f ollo win g reco rd e d vote :  aye , Ms. Dorca s Bro u , Mr. 

Ed Curt is, Hon . J. Phil Gilb e rt , Dr. Ed High t o we r, Ms. Haile e O ’ De ll, Ms. Sara M. Salge r, Dr. 

Sub ha sh Sha rm a , Mr. Joh n Simm on s and Mr. Roge r Ted rick; nay, non e .     

Unde r Comm it t ee Repo rt s, the Cha ir rep o rt ed tha t the Exe cu t ive Comm it t ee 

had not met betwe e n Boa rd mee t in gs.  

Dr . Dan Maho n y, Pre sid e n t, Sou th e rn Illin o is Unive rsit y, pro v id e d his rep o rt 

for the SIU syst e m .  He pro vid e d an upd a te on the Strat e gic Pla n and sha re d the re is now 

a draf t docum e nt tha t has been put toge t h e r base d upo n the work of the 15 imp lem e nt a t ion 

team s which outlin e s stra t e gie s and the metrics and tim e lin e s f or tho se stra te gie s.  He 

exp e ct s to be able to sha re the docum en t with the Boa rd and pub lic soo n.   

Presid e nt Mah on y high ligh t e d goa l one in the stra t e gic pla n rega rd ing stu d e n t 

succe ss and aca d em ic inn o va t ion .  Dr. Gire e sh Gup ch up has bee n taki n g the lead  in  

workin g with the Nation a l Asso cia t io n of Syste m Hea d s (NA S H) Netwo rke d Im p ro vem e nt 

Comm u n it ie s with a part icu la r f ocu s on cou rse sha rin g acro ss the syst e m .  SIU has been 

meet in g with part ne rs and oth e r syst e m s who are tryin g to do the sam e t yp e of thin g .   He 

exp e ct s to have an onlin e cou rse sha rin g infra st ru ct u re sche du le d for Fall 2023 .  He said 

this is a crit ica l part of the enro llm e nt stra teg y movin g f orwa rd and will e xp a n d a lot of 

oppo rt u n it ie s f or stu d en t s.  

Next , Pre sid e n t Maho ny pro vid e d an upda t e rela t ed to anti - ra cism , dive rsit y, 

equ it y and inclu sio n .  He said Dr. She ila Cald we ll has take n on a lot of natio na l role s and 

has been invo lve d in man y pre se nt a t ion s.  She will be pre sen t in g  at the nation a l asso cia t ion 



1 2  
 

for dive rsit y off ice rs in high e r  edu ca t io n on c am pu s clima t e and inclu sio n as follo w  up to 

the cam pu s clim a te  rep o rt  at SIU .  The re wa s also an article  in INSIGHT Into Diversity on 

SIU ’ s cam p u s c l im at e surve y.  Add it io n a lly, Dr. Cald we ll coo rd in a t ed  the ADEI Lea de rsh ip 

Cert if ica te  which is offe re d acro ss the cam pu se s for stu de n t s to enh an ce the ir edu cat ion 

exp e rie n ce by doin g a numb e r of diff e re n t activit ie s .   Presid e n t Mah on y said the re are  

alre a d y  120 stu d en t s invo lve d .  Dr. Mah o n y also men t ion e d the esta b lish me n t of the ADE I 

Life t ime Ach ie ve me n t Awa rd ; the crit e ria has been set to hono r an ind ivid u a l who has 

perf o rme d outst a nd in g work in ADE I .   

Presid e nt Maho n y men t io ne d a lot of activit y is con t inu in g with in the Inst itu t e 

of Rura l Hea lt h and the Off ice for Com mu n ity Enga ge m e n t.  He said he is exp e ct in g a $1 

millio n leve l of sup po rt f rom the fede ra l gove rn m e nt to pro vid e sup p o rt rela t ive to workf o rce 

deve lo p me n t as well as ope rat io n a l fund s to help both 
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  Dr. Jam e s T. Min o r , Cha n ce llo r, SIU Edwa rdsvil le , pro vid e d his repo rt f or the 

Edwa rd svi lle camp u s.   He said f or the seco n d con se cu t ive yea r, SIUE has reco rd f irst - ye a r 
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Cha n ce llo r Lan e discu sse d the bra nd in g and part n e rsh ip eff o rts of the 

cam pu s.  He talked abo u t  the com mu n ica t io n metho d s  and the outlet s the cam pu s is usin g 

to g et its messa ge out.  The camp u s has been run n in g comme rcia ls and the them e 

“ Im a gin e 203 0 ” makin g the poin t of sta rt in g wi th SIU Carb on d a le and goin g anywh e re with 

the messa ge bein g ima gin e wha t you can do if you atte n d the universit y and whe re it can 

take you .  

Cha n ce llo r Lane high ligh t e d Tim Hurle y, an assist a n t prof e sso r in acco u n t in g, 

and his stu de n t s who won a nation a l vict o ry.  He also high ligh t e d Cost a s Tsa t sou lis, Vice 

Cha n ce llo r for Rese a rch , f or his work in gr a d ua t e stu de n t recru it m e nt , rete n t ion and 

gra d u a t e stu de n t resea rch .   

In rega rd s to susta in ab ilit y, the camp u s is pla n n in g a maste r pla n kick - o ff to 

revie w wha t the cam pu s will loo k like betwe e n now and 2030 .  It wi ll be a colle ct ive eff ort 

tha t will take pla ce with sta keh o ld e rs acro ss the cam pu s to pro vid e inp u t.  

In con clu sio n , Chan ce llo r Lane sha re d tha t the Misso u ri Valle y Conf e re n c e 

hono re d Tru ste e Ted rick f or his sup po rt of the C onf e ren ce and pre sen t e d him with a jerse y 

at a Salu ki basket b a ll gam e .  Cha n ce llo r Lane tha n ked Tru st e e Ted rick for atte n d in g.  

D r. Jerr y Kru se , Dea n and Pro vo st , SIU  Sch o o l of Med icine , pro vid e d his 

rep o rt for the Scho o l of Med icine .   Dr. Kru se ’ s rep o rt f ocu sed on acce ss to men t a l hea lt h 
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CHANG E S IN FACULT Y - A DMI NI S T RAT IV E PAYRO L L –  SIUC  
 

 The follo win g cha n ge s in facu lt y - a d m in ist rat ive payro ll are subm it te d to the 
Boa rd of Tru st ee s for rati f ica t ion in acco rda n ce with the Boa rd Policy on Perso nn e l 
App ro va l (2 Policie s of the Boa rd B). Add it ion a l deta iled info rma t ion is ava ila b le f rom the 
Off ice of the Cha n ce llor. W he re app rop ria t e , sala ry is rep o rt e d on a mon t h ly basis and on 
eith e r an aca de m ic yea r (AY) or f isca l yea r (FY) basis.  
 
A.  Init ia l App o int me n t s of Facu lt y to Tenu re d and Ten u re Tra ck and Init ia l Appo in tm en t s 

and Prom o t ion s of Prof e ssion a l Staf f (If the perso n pre vio u sly had a Unive rsit y 
appo in tm e nt , it is so note d.  Oth e rwise , the perso n is a new Unive rs it y em p lo ye e . )  

 
 Name  Rank/T it le  Depar t m ent
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CHANG E S IN FACULT Y - A DMI NI S T RAT IV E PAYRO L L –  SIU SCHO O L OF MEDI CI NE  
 

 The follo win g cha n ge s in facu lt y - a d m in ist ra t ive payro ll at the Sch o o l of 
Med icin e / Sp rin gf ie ld cam pu s are subm it te d to the Boa rd of Tru ste e s for ratif ica t ion in 
acco rd an ce with the Boa rd Policy on Perso n ne l App ro va l (2 Policie s of t he Boa rd  B). 
Add it ion a l deta ile d info rm a t io n is on f ile in the Office of the Dea n and Pro vo st . . W he re 
app rop ria t e , sala ry is rep o rt ed on a mon th ly basis and on eith e r an aca de m ic yea r (AY) or 
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7.  Dan ie ls, Lisa  
 

Dep a rtm e n t 
Adm in ist ra t o r  
 

Can ce r Inst it u te  
 

11/14 / 22   
 

$10,4 1 6. 6 7 MO  
$125,0 00 . 00 FY  
(Pre vio u sl y  
$6,65 1 .2 4 MO  
$79,8 1 4. 8 8 FY)  
 

8.  Fost e r, Ann e  
 

Cert if ied 
Nurse 
Pra ct it io ne r  
 

Surge ry  11/23 / 22  
 

 $7,91 6 .6 7 / MO  
$95,0 0 0. 0 0/ FY  
 

9.  Fra n klin , 
Jeff re y  
 

Exe cu t ive 
Dire ct o r of 
CRHS S D 
(Pre vio u sl y 
Dire ct o r of 
CRHS S D)  

Cen t e r of  Rura l 
Hea lt h  
 

9/1 6/ 2 2  
 

 $11,9 1 9. 0 9/ MO , 
$143,0 29 . 10 / FY 
(Pre vio u sl y 
$10,2 5 0. 0 0/ MO , 
$123,0 00 . 00 / YR)  
 

10.  Ham , Erin  
 

Rese a rch 
Pro je ct 
Spe cia list  
 

Pop u la t io n 
Scie n ce & 
Policy  
 

11/14 / 22  
 

 $3,75 0 .0 0 / MO  
$45,0 0 0. 0 0/ FY  
 

11.  Kelly, Colle e n  
 

Cert if ied 
Physicia n 
Assist a n t  
 

Psych ia t ry  
 

01/09 / 23  
 

 $9,58 3 .3 3 / MO  
$115,0 00 . 00 / FY  
 

12.  Lin d gre n , 
She rri  
 
 

Certif ied 
Nurse 
Pra ct it io ne r  
 

Fam ily & 
Comm u n it y 
Med icin e  

12/12 / 22  
 

 $11,2 5 0. 0 0/ MO  
$135,0 00 . 00 / FY  
 

13.  Mad o n ia, 
Christ in e  
 
 
 

Assist a n t to 
the Cha ir of 
OB/G YN  

OB/G YN  12/05 / 22   
 

$9,99 2 .5 8 / MO  
$119,9 10 . 96  
(Pre vio u sl y  
$6,49 9 .6 6 / MO  
$77,9 9 5. 9 2 FY)  
 

14.  
 

McMa h o n , 
Vicki  
 

Curricu lu m 
Deve lo p m en t 
Spe cia list  
 

Edu cat io n & 
Curricu lu m  
 

11/14 / 22  
 

 $7,36 9 .4 2 / MO  
$88,4 3 3. 0 4/ FY  
 

15.  Mon t go me ry, 
Ben jam in  
 

Assist a n t 
Prof e sso r of 
Clin ica l 
Inte rna l 
Med icin e  
 

Corre ct io n a l 
Med icin e  
 

01/09 / 23  
 

 $20,8 3 4. 0 0/ MO  
$250,0 00 . 00 / FY  
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16.  Sto lle r, Mega n  
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H.  Pro m ot io n s of Ten u red and Tenu re Tra ck Facu lt y:   
 

 Nam e  Title on Eff e ct ive Date of Tenu re  Dep a rtm e n t  Eff e ct ive 
Date  

1.   
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13.   Poin t e r, Caro lyn  Asso cia t e Prof e sso r  Med ica l 
Hum an it ie s  

7/1 /2 0 23  

14.   Qua de r, Zafa r  
 
 

Asso cia t e Clin ica l Prof e sso r  Inte rna l 
Med icin e  

7/1 /2 0 23  

Rob in so n, Robe rt Clin ica l Pro f e sso r I n t e rna l 
Med icin e  

7/1 /2 0 23

Ro se , Jen n if e r  
 
 
 

Asso cia t e Clin ica l Prof e sso r  Fam ily & 
Comm u n it y 
Med icin e  
 

7/1 /2 0 23  

Salam , Hossam Abdu l A sso cia t e Clin ica l Prof e sso r P e d ia t rics 7 / 1 /2 0 23

S a le h , Ezze ld in A sso cia t e Clin ica l Prof e sso r P e d ia t rics 7 / 1 /2 0 23

S a t t o via , Sta cy Clin ica l Pro f e sso r I n t e rna l 
Med icin e

7 / 1 /2 0 23

S co t t , Mary Kath e rin e A sso cia t e Clin ica l Prof e sso r P e d ia t rics 7 / 1 /2 0 23
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CHANG E S IN FACULT Y - A DMI NI S T RAT IV E PAYRO L L –  SIUE  
 
 The follo win g cha n ge s in facu lt y - a d m in ist rat ive payro ll are subm it te d to the 
Boa rd of Tru st ee s for ratif ica t ion in acco rda n ce with the Boa rd Policy on Perso nn e l 
App ro va l (2 Policie s of the Boa rd B). Add it io na l deta iled inf o rm a t ion is on f ile in the Off ice 
of the Chan ce llo r. W he re app rop ria t e , sala ry is repo rt e d on a mon th ly basis and on eith e r 
an aca d em ic yea r (AY) or f isca l yea r (FY) basis.  
 
A.  Init ia l App o int me n t s of Facu lt y to Ten u red and Ten u re Tra ck and Init ia l App o in tme n t s 

and Prom o t io n s of Pro f e ssio na l Staf f  (If the person pre vio u sly had a Unive rsit y 
appo in tm e nt , it is so note d.  Oth e rwise , the perso n is a new Unive rs it y em p lo ye e . )  

 
 Nam e  Rank /T itle  Depar tm ent  Ef f ec tive 

Date  
 Sal ar y  

 

1.  Drukt einis, 
Saulius  
 

Dean 
(pr eviously: 

Associat e Dean)  
 

School of 
Dent al 

Med icine  
 

01/1 6/20 23   $12,500. 00/ m o  
$300, 000. 00/ FY 

(pr evi ous l y: 
$7,8 52.1 9/m o 

$188 ,45 2.56 /F Y)  
 

2.  Izq uier do, 
Mar k  

Associat e 
Dir ect or  

Int er colleg iat e 
Athlet ics  

11/2 9/20 22   $6,6166. 68/ m o 
$74,000. 16/ FY  

 
3.  Naur ot h, 

Mar k us  
Assist ant 
Prof essor  

 

CMI S  01/0 1/20 23   $14,000. 00/ m o   
$126, 000. 00/ AY  

 
4.  Robinder , 

W endy  
Academ ic 
Advisor II  

School of 
Eng ineer ing  

 

11/0 2/20 22   $3,791. 66/ m o 
$45,499. 92/ FY  

 
5.    Schoe nher r , 

Mar k  
Academ ic 
Advisor II  

 

School of 
Nur sing  

 

11/0 7/20 22   $3,955. 52/ m o 
$47,466. 24/ FY  
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B. 
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12.  VanSlet t e, Sar ah  Sabbat ical  App l i ed 
Com m un ic a t io n s  

100%  1/01/ 2024 - 5/ 15/ 2024  

 Purp o se :  Prof e sso r Van S le tt e will writ e and sub m it one article for pub lica t io n and 
pre se n ta t ion at a nation a l or inte rn a t io n a l conf e re n ce on the sub je ct of dive rsit y, 
equ it y, and inclu sion in PR ped a go gy.  
 

13.  W ang, Feng xia  Sabbat ical  Mechan ical 
Eng ineer ing 

100%  8/16/ 2023 - 12/ 31/ 2023  

 Purp o se :  Prof e sso r W an g wil l do resea rch on rob ot dyn am ics and con t ro l which will 
resu lt in a pub lish e d jou rn a l pap e r.  
 

14.  W are, Robert  Sabbat ical  School of 
Eng ineer ing 

100%  8/16/ 2023 - 12/ 31/ 2023  

 Purp o se :  Prof e sso r W are will go to Oxfo rd Unive rsit y to conf e r with colle a gu e s and 
com p le t e work on a boo k. He will sub m it the boo k for pub lica t ion .  
 

15.  Zeng, Yuping Sabbat ical  Manag em ent 
& Mar k et ing  

100%  1/01/ 2024 - 5/ 15/ 2024  

 Purp o se :   Prof e sso r Zen g wil l deve lo p a datase t and comp le t e the f irst mult i - co un t ry 
exa m in a t ion of the ante ce de n t s of the dece rt if icat io n of Cert if ied B Corp o ra t ion s.  
 

16.  Zhou, Bin  Sabbat ical  Geog r aphy & 
GIS  

100%  1/01/ 2024 - 5/ 15/ 2024  

 Purp o se :   Prof e sso r Zho u will com p let e fou r sam p le cha p te rs of a boo k on adva n ce d 
spa t ia l mod e lin g techn iqu e s .  
 

C .  A w a r d s  o f  T e n u r e -  Non e to rep o rt  
 
D .  A w a r d s  o f  P r o m o t i o n -  Non e to rep o rt  
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PROP OS E D REVIS I ON S TO THE BOA R D  OF  TRUS T E E S DE BT  POLI CY                            
[ AME N D ME NT S T O 5 POLI CIE S OF THE BOA RD P]  

 
Summ a ry  

 
This  matt er  



3 0  
 

Reso lu t io n  
 

BE  IT  RES OLV E D,  By  th e  Boar d of Tru stee s  of Sout her n Il lino is  
Un iver sit y in  regu lar  meet in g as sem bl ed,  That:  

 
(1)      5  Policies of  th e  Boar d P  is  her eby  amen de d as pe r  t h e  

atta che d.  
 

  (2)  The  Pre side n t  of  Sou t h e rn  Illin o is  Unive rsit y  be and is  here by  
autho rize d to  take  wha t e ve r  actio n may  be requ ire d in the  exe cu t ion of  this  reso lu t ion .  
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Southern Illinois University System 
Debt Policy 
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2. Revenue Bonds 

The Board is authorized to issue revenue bonds pursuant to the Southern Illinois 
University Revenue Bond Act (110 ILCS 525/1 et seq.) (the “Revenue Bond Act”) for 
the purpose of acquiring “projects” as defined in Section 525/2(5) and to refund 
bonds as provided in Section 525/4 (B) and (C). The sources of payment of such 
revenue bonds, as provided by the Revenue Bond Act and as authorized by 
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Section 110 ILCS 62/25 provides that the University may issue debt certificates to 
finance an installment payment contract or lease purchase agreement for the 
purchase and installation of the energy conservation measures.  

5. Illinois Procurement Code 

The Illinois Procurement Code (30 ILCS 500) contains limitation provisions which 
apply both to the issuance of revenue bonds and to the issuance of installment 
contract certificates of participation. Service providers instrumental in the issuance 
of debt must be approved through a competitive request for proposal (RFP) process.  
Certain participants may be exempt from the procurement process.  In addition, 
certificates of participation installment contracts are limited to a maximum duration 
of 10 years per the Illinois Procurement Code. 

6. Illinois Board of Higher Education 

The Board of Higher Education Act (110 ILCS 205/0.01 et seq.) requires that the 
University submit its plan for capital improvement of non-instructional facilities to 
the Illinois Board of Higher Education (the “IBHE”) for approval before final 
commitments are made if the total cost of the project, as approved by the Board, is 
in excess of $2 million. Non-instructional facilities include, but are not limited to, 
residence halls, stadiums, student centers, recreational facilities, and parking lots.  
The IBHE shall determine whether or not any project submitted for approval is 
consistent with the master plan for higher education and with instructional 
buildings that are provided for therein.   

7. Legislative Audit Commission Guidelines 

The Legislative Audit Guidelines limit describe the purpose for which revenue bonds 
may be issued, the uses of funds, the sources of payment and the accumulation of 
excess reserves.   

 
III. Establish Framework for Prioritizing Projects and Approving Debt Issuance 



3 4  
 



3 5  
 

The University recognizes that its strategy and mission must be the primary drivers of its 
capital investment and use of debt. External credit ratings provide a view on debt capacity 
and affordability, and will be used to help maintain a strong financial profile.   

 
V. Debt Compliance and Reporting Requirements 

In order to have continued access to the capital financing markets, the University must 
comply with Securities and Exchange Commission (SEC) laws, various Internal Revenue 
Service rules and regulations, and bond covenant requirements.  Compliance and reporting 
are required both upon the issuance of debt and during the post-issuance phase which 
extends through and beyond the life of the debt obligation. The Board Treasurer is 
responsible for ensuring these compliance and reporting requirements are maintained. 

1. Compliance with the SEC Laws 

The University will meet its ongoing disclosure requirements in accordance with the 
Securities Exchange Commission Rule 15c2-12, by submitting financial reports, 
statistical data, and any other material events as required.  

2. Compliance with IRS Regulations 

In order to access tax-exempt financing, the University must comply with all applicable 
IRS regulations including, but not limited to, regulations relating to the use of bond 
proceeds, the use of bond financed facilities, and arbitrage in order to maintain the debt 
instrument’s tax-exempt status.    

3. Compliance with Covenants 
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�x Record Retention 
�x Continuing Disclosure 

 
VI. Debt Management Strategies 

When selecting a debt management strategy, all options will be evaluated within the 
context of balancing the goals of limiting managing 
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Footnotes 
¹ The Tax Cuts and Jobs Act of 2017 eliminated the ability of governmental issuers and issuers of qualified 501(c)(3) 
bonds to issue advance refunded bonds on a tax-exempt basis after December 31, 2017.  IRC Section 149(d) places 
limits on advance refundings which it defines as a bond issued to advance refund another bond more than 90 days 
before the redemption of the refunded bond. 
 
 
 
 

 

Attribution 

This policy was developed, in part, or incorporates language, based upon the debt policies of the University of Illinois, 
University of North Carolina and Oregon State University.  Because legal structure and debt issuance are governed by 
state and federal laws and statues, this policy may look very similar to other institutions. 
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APPROVA L OF PURCHA S E : 340B PHA RMACE UT I CA L PROG RAM,  
SCHO O L OF MEDI CINE , SIUC  

 
Summ a ry  
 
  This matt e r see ks app ro va l to incre a se the awa rd am ou n t for the SIU Sch oo l 
of Med icin e 340B Pha rma ce ut ica l Pro gra m f or the purch a se of com mo d it ie s f rom 
McK e sso n Med ica l Surgica l Inco rp o ra te d .  
 
Ratio n a le f or Ado p t io n  
 
  The Sch oo l of Med icine ’ s Cent e r for Fam ily Med icin e curre n t ly particip a t e s in 
the f ed e ra l 340 B Pha rma ce ut ica l Pro gra m , which is regu la t e d by the Off ice of 
Pha rm a ceu t ica l Affa irs (OPA ) and man age d by Hea lth Reso u rce s and Service s 
Adm in ist ra t io n (HRS A ).  
   

This pro gra m pro vid e s patien t s the abilit y to purch a se outp at ie n t med ica t io n s 
and med ica l sup p lie s at sign if ican t ly red u ced cost s. The dru g manuf a ctu re rs are req u ire d 
to pass the savin gs on to the pro gra m part icip a n t s. The tota l cost of this purch a se will be 
fun de d by non - a p p ro p ria t ed f un d s and reve n u e gen e ra te d thro u gh the 340 B 
Pha rma ceu t ica l Pro gram .  

 
  Due to the succe ss of the pro gra m, exp e nd itu re s f or the curre n t f isca l yea r 
are pro je cte d to exce ed the amo un t pre vio u sly app ro ve d by the Board of Tru ste e s in April 
2022 .  This matt e r seeks to increa se the pre vio u sly app ro ve d awa rd to McK e sso n Med ica l 
Surgica l Inco rp o rat e d by an add it io na l $1,500 , 0 00 for a tota l awa rd of $3,30 0 ,0 0 0 .  
 



4 0  
 

 
(3) The exp e n d itu re will be fund e d by non - ap p ro p ria t e







Parking Lot Improvements RFQ 2371
December 20,2022 10:00 a.m./2:00 p.m.

Contractors Base Bid G-1 Base Bid G-2

Byrne & Jones Construction

13940 St. Charles Rock Road 2,577,775.00$               2,789,700.00$            

St. Louis, MO 63044

The Kilian Corporation
608 South Independence Street 2,829,785.00$               2,998,675.00$            
Mascoutah, IL 62258

Rooters American Maintenance Inc.
350 Carter Street PO Box 175 2,856,380.00$               3,339,900.00$            
Beckemeyer, IL 62219

Keller Construction Inc.
22 Illini Drive 3,099,800.00$               No Bid
Glen Carbon, IL 62034

DMS Contracting Inc.
10243 Fuesser Road 3,167,000.00$               3,425,000.00$            
Mascoutah, IL 62258

Stutz Excavating Inc.
3837 Fosterberg Road No Bid 3,800,000.00$            
Alton, IL 62002



Parking Lot Improvements RFQ 2371
December 20,2022 10:00 a.m./2:00 p.m.

Electrical Contractors Base Bid E-1 Base Bid E-2 Alt E-1

Pyramid Electrical Contractors

300 Monticello Place 348,707.00$                  394,927.00$               511,828.00$               

Fairview Heights IL 62208

Wissehr Electric Inc

5801 W State Route 161 479,200.00$                  591,900.00$               639,100.00$               

Belleville IL 62223
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APPRO V AL OF EASEME NT S : TEMP O RA RY CONS T RUCT I O N EAS E ME NT S , CIT Y OF 
EDW ARDS V IL L E, AND PERMA NE NT EASEME NT , ILL I NO IS DEPA RT ME NT OF 
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Con sid e ra t io n s Aga in st Adop t ion  
 

This pro je ct may cau se a temp o ra ry disru p t io n in the easem en t con st ru ct io n 
are a s, howe ve r, it shou ld not have an im pa ct on camp u s traf f ic or activit ie s .  

 
Reso lu t io n  

O (esLV)E(i)1D88 66 (ev)B(i)17 (por)(i)6 (onB)
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Reso lu t io n  
 
  BE IT RESO L VE D, By the Boa rd of Tru ste e s of Sou t he rn Illin o is Unive rsit y in 
regu la r meet in g assemb le d , Tha t :  
 

(1) 



BID TABULATION
IFB M100422 GIR 22053

General Bid Opening: 11/3/2022

A A A A A A A A A A T
L L L L L L L L L L O
T T T T T T T T T T T
E E E E E E E E E E A
R R R R R R R R R R L
N N N N N N N N N N
A A A A A A A A A A A

B T T T T T T T T T T C
A E E E E E E E E E E C
S E

  Invitations:  7 E B B B B B B B B B B P
  No Bid:  0 I I I I I I I I I I T
  No Reply:  4 B D D D D D D D D D D E

I D
D 1A 1B 2A 2B 3A 3B 4A 4B 5 6

  BIDDERS
JL Robinson Development & 
Construction Company

501 W. Industrial Park Road $524,000 $160,000 $4,400 $315,000 ($22,000) $101,000 ($600) $36,000 ($2,200) $22,000 ($5,200) $1,162,400
Carbondale, IL  62901$8lBid��1A���r�r��Provide��Business��Support��Annex��&��Corridor��0102��construction

Alternate��Bid��1B���r�r��Provide��new��cabinets��in��Business��Support��Annex��Kitchen��Prep
Alternate��Bid��2A���r�r��Provide��Analytic��Core��Lab��A��0112��construction
DEDUCT��Alternate��Bid��2B���r�r��Provide��salvaged��laboratory��casework��in��the��Analytical��Core��Lab��A��area��in��lieu��of��new��

casework

DEDUCT��Alternate��Bid��3B���r�r��Provide��salvaged��laboratory��casework��in��the��Analytical��Core��Lab��B��0114��area��in��lieu��



BID TABULATION
IFB M100422 GIR 22053

Plumbing Bid Opening: 11/3/2022

A A A A T
L L L L O
T T T T T
E E E E A
R R R R L
N N N N
A A A A A

B T T T T C
A E E E E C
S E

  Invitations:  3 E B B B B P
  No Bid:  0 I I I I T
  No Reply:  0 B D D D D E

I D
D 1A 2A 3A 4A

  BIDDERS
A & W Plumbing & Heating, Inc.
11 Alliance Avenue $433,700 $12,000 $32,300 $20,800 $3,900 $502,700
Murphysboro, IL  62966

Litton Enterprises, Inc.

3305 W. Commercial Road $446,485 $19,338 $58,439 $41,271 $5,926
Maion, IL  62959

Southern Illinois Piping 
Contractors, Inc
1100 S. Reed Station Road $438,200 $12,200 $50,400 $30,400 $5,500
Carbondale, IL  62902

BioLaunch Core Facility

Alternate��Bid��1A���r�r��Provide��Business��Support��Annex��&��Corridor��0102��construction
Alternate��Bid��2A���r�r��Provide��Analytic��Core��Lab��A��0112��construction
Alternate��Bid��3A���r�r��Provide��the��Analytical��Core��Lab��B��0114��construction
Alternate��Bid��4A���r�r��Provide��Distillation��Analysis��Lab��109g��construction



BID TABULATION
IFB M100422 GIR 22053

Mechanical Bid Opening: 11/3/2022

A A A A T
L L L L O
T T T T T
E E E E A
R R R R L
N N N N
A A A A A

B T T T T C
A E E E E C
S E

  Invitations:  3 E B B B B P
  No Bid:  0 I I I I T
  No Reply:  0 B D D D D E

I D
D 1A 2A 3A 4A

  BIDDERS
Heartland Mechanical 
Contractors
511 Health Department Road $296,500 $25,400 $96,400 $57,000 $2,700 $478,000
Murphysboro, IL  62966

Southern Illinois Piping 
Contractors, Inc
1100 S. Reed Station Road $355,000 $15,000 $126,000 $55,500 $3,500
Carbondale, IL  62902

A & W Plumbing & Heating, Inc.
11 Alliance Avenue $347,500 $25,000 $141,000 $73,000 $4,000
Murphysboro, IL  62966

BioLaunch Core Facility

Alternate��Bid��1A���r�r��Provide��Business��Support��Annex��&��Corridor��0102��construction
Alternate��Bid��2A���r�r��Provide��Analytic��Core��Lab��A��0112��construction
Alternate��Bid��3A���r�r��Provide��the��Analytical��Core��Lab��B��0114��construction
Alternate��Bid��4A���r�r��Provide��Distillation��Analysis��Lab��109g��construction



BID TABULATION
IFB M100422 GIR 22053

Electrical Bid Opening: 11/3/2022

A A A A T
L L L L O
T T T T T
E E E E A
R R R R L
N N N N
A A A A A

B T T T T C
A E E E E C
S E

  Invitations:  5 E B B B B P
  No Bid:  0 I I I I T
  No Reply:  4 B D D D D E

I D
D 1A 2A 3A 4A

  BIDDERS
WJ Burke Electric Company
PO Box 462 $275,500 $65,500 $122,250 $79,750 $7,600 $550,600
Pmurphysboro, IL  62966

BioLaunch Core Facility

Alternate��Bid��1A���r�r��Provide��Business��Support��Annex��&��Corridor��0102��construction
Alternate��Bid��2A���r�r��Provide��Analytic��Core��Lab��A��0112��construction
Alternate��Bid��3A���r�r��Provide��the��Analytical��Core��Lab��B��0114��construction
Alternate��Bid��4A���r�r��Provide��Distillation��Analysis��Lab��109g��construction
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Dr. Sub h a sh Sha rma , Mr. Joh n Sim mo n s; nay, non e .   Mr. Ed Curt is and Mr. Roge r Ted rick 

abst a in e d f ro m votin g.  

The f ollo win g ite m was pre se nt e d:  
 

REPO RT S OF PURCHA S E ORDE RS AND CONT RA CTS ,  
OCTO BE R, NOV E MBE R, AND DECE MB E R, 2022 , SIUE 

 
  In acco rda n ce with 3 Byla ws  1 and 5 Policie s of the Boa rd C, summ a ry 
rep o rt s of purcha se ord e rs and cont ra ct s awa rd e d durin g the mon th s of Octo be r, 
Nove m b e r, and Decem b e r, 202 2 , were maile d to the memb e rs of the Boa rd in adva n ce of 
this mee t in g, cop ie s were pla ce d on f ile in the Off ice of the Boa rd of Tru st e e s, and the se 
rep o rt s are hereb y subm it t ed for info rma t io n and entry upon the min u t e s of the Boa rd with 
resp e ct to the actio n s of the Exe cu t ive Comm it t ee .   
 

Trust ee Brou  mo ve d app ro va l of the rece ip t of the item .  The motio n was duly 

seco nd e d by Tru st ee Sha rma .  The motio n carrie d by the follo win g reco rd e d vote :  aye , 

Ms. Dorca s Brou , Mr. Ed Curt is, Hon . J. Phil Gilb e rt , Dr. Ed High t o we r, Ms. Haile e O ’ De ll, 

Ms. Sara Salge r, Dr. Sub ha sh Sha rm a , Mr. Joh n Simm on s ; nay, non e .   Mr. Roge r Ted rick 

abst a in e d f ro m votin g.  

Cha ir Gilb e rt anno u n ce d tha t the next Boa rd of Tru ste e s meet in g is  pla n ne d 

for April 27, 202 3 , at Sou t he rn Illin o is Unive rsit y Carb o n d a le .  Furthe r, he rep o rt ed tha t a 

news conf e ren ce wou ld be held imm ed ia t e ly follo win g the mee t in g.     

Trust ee  Salge r  mad e a motio n to adjo u rn the meet in g.  Trustee 




